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INTRODUCTION 
 
This document has been prepared for use in completion of applicable Section 106 procedures in 
compliance with the National Historic Preservation Act (NHPA) of 1966 and subsequent 
amendments.  The documentation has been developed in accordance with the GDOT/FHWA 
Cultural Resource Survey Guidelines and 36 CFR Part 800.  As such, this document assesses the 
effects to historic properties identified within the area of potential effects of GDOT Project 
BRST0-0052-01(012), Walton County. 
 
The design of the proposed project was developed by GDOT engineering personnel who, as a 
standard procedure, include environmental parameters as a part of the initial investigations prior 
to laying out a proposed design.  Basic data of the project area that was gathered and studied 
included aerial photography, topographic maps, traffic (existing and projected), previous studies, 
wetland inventory maps, soil survey maps, flood plain maps, and Georgia Department of Natural 
Resources' historic resource survey maps. 
 
That data was used to delineate wetland or hydric soil boundaries, flood plains, parks and 
recreational facilities, known or suspected historic properties and archaeological sites, existing 
rights-of-way, possible UST/landfill/hazardous waste sites, and areas of possible endangered 
species habitat on the aerial photography prior to laying out an alignment.  In addition, other 
"controls" such as churches, cemeteries, schools, hospitals, and any other noise sensitive areas 
were also identified. 
 
Only at this point was the proposed alignment developed with every attempt being made to avoid 
sensitive ecological, historic, and archaeological areas.  In the event that avoidance was not 
possible, every attempt was made to minimize harm to such resources.  The proposed alignment, 
once laid out, was then field checked and additional refinements were made to further minimize 
harm to both the natural and built environment. 
 
 

NEED AND PURPOSE 
 

The proposed project would replace the structurally deficient bridge on SR 11 over the CSX 
Railroad in Social Circle, Georgia.  The bridge was built in 1954 and consists of concrete bents, 
steel beam structure, and a concrete deck. The bridge is functionally obsolete due to bridge width 
and design load.   
 
The Department’s Policy for bridge replacement, Policy #2405-1, requires that if a bridge 
receives a Sufficiency Rating of less than 50, replacement of that bridge is necessary.  The 
Sufficiency Rating for the bridge carrying SR 11 over the CSX Railroad tracks is 46.76.  
Additionally, the bridge is being proposed for replacement because it was originally designed for 
H-15 loading, and GDOT’s standards require these type bridges be upgraded or replaced. 
 
Replacing the bridge on SR 11 over the CSX Railroad would bring it up to current AASHTO 
geometric design standards.  The purpose of the proposed improvement is to provide better 
mobility through this section of SR 11 and create a safer driving environment for through and 
local traffic.  The proposed project is necessary and recommended to enhance the operating 
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serviceability and provide a bridge that would adequately and safely serve current and future 
travel demand on this portion of State Route 11. 
 
 

DESCRIPTION OF THE UNDERTAKING 
 
GDOT Project BRST0-0052-01(012) is federally funded.  Therefore, Section 106 compliance is 
being processed through the Federal Highway Administration (FHWA).   
 
The proposed project would consist of the replacement of a structurally deficient bridge on SR 
11 over CSX Railroad in Social Circle, Walton County (refer to Figure 1: Project and Resource 
Location Map). The existing bridge measures 151 feet with a deck width of 35.3 feet.  The 
existing right-of-way is 60 feet. The replacement bridge would measure 160 feet in length with 
44 feet of clear width (per MOG 4265-10). The right-of-way would be maintained at 60 feet. 
Traffic would be maintained in place; one lane of SR 11 would be closed during staged 
construction while one lane would remain open.  Temporary signals situated at either end of the 
bridge would control the flow of traffic.   
 
Since the distribution of the Section 106 Notification on May 6, 2004, the proposed project 
description has become more clearly defined.  Replacement of the bridge requires that CSX 
Railroad height clearance standards be accommodated in the project; as such, the bridge 
clearance height would be raised by four feet to meet the standards. 
 
As defined in 36 CFR 800.16(d), the area of potential effects (APE) of an undertaking is defined 
as "the geographic area or areas within which an undertaking may directly or indirectly cause 
changes in the character or use of historic properties, if any such properties exist".  Based on this 
definition, the nature and scope of the undertaking, the guidance in the GDOT/FHWA Cultural 
Resource Survey Guidelines, and past experience with similar projects, the APE was defined, in 
consultation with the Georgia SHPO as the view shed and the existing right-of-way of the 
proposed project, within which all construction and ground disturbing activity would be confined 
(refer to Figure 1: Project and Resource Location Map). No potential for indirect effects is 
anticipated by implementation of the proposed project.  
 
 

IDENTIFICATION OF HISTORIC PROPERTIES AND PUBLIC INVOLVEMENT 
 
Existing information on previously identified historic properties was checked to determine if any 
are located within the APE of this undertaking.  This review included National Register listed 
properties, proposed National Register nominations, National Historic Landmarks, and the 
updated Georgia Historic Bridge Survey (GHBS).  The Department of Natural Resources (DNR) 
Walton County survey dated 2002 was consulted.  The state archaeological site files at the 
University of Georgia and existing survey reports were consulted to locate previously identified 
archaeological sites within the APE.  Also topographic maps and aerial photography were 
reviewed to identify areas of high archaeological site potential within the APE. 
 
Following the review of existing information on previously identified historic properties, 
potential consulting parties in the Section 106 process were identified.  In addition to the Georgia  
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SHPO, other potential consulting parties were identified based on the nature of the undertaking 
and the guidance in the GDOT/FHWA Cultural Resource Survey Guidelines.  The other 
potential consulting parties invited to participate in the Section 106 process were the Northeast 
Georgia Regional Development Center, the Walton County Historical Society, the Historic 
Preservation Society of Social Circle, and the City of Social Circle.  These consulting parties 
were informed of our efforts to locate previously identified historic properties and the results of 
those efforts and were asked to provide information on any unidentified National Register listed 
or potentially eligible historic properties within the proposed project's APE by a Notification 
dated May 6, 2004 (see Notification in Appendix A).  Responses were received from James 
Dove of the Northeast Georgia Regional Development Center, and Elizabeth Shirk of the SHPO, 
dated May 18, 2004, and May 19, 2004, respectively, to the Department's invitation to become a 
consulting party in the Section 106 process (see Appendix A). No other invited parties responded 
to the Department’s invitation to become a consulting party in the Section 106 Process.  
 
Finally, after reviewing any additional information received from consulting parties, field 
surveys and background research were conducted within the APE of the proposed project to 
identify any historic properties or archaeological sites eligible for listing in the National Register.  
The results of the field surveys and background research were summarized in a Survey Report 
and an Archaeological Assessment.  Those reports were provided to all consulting parties 
participating in the Section 106 process for review and comment. 
 
As a result of these identification efforts, one National Register listed historic resource was 
identified within the proposed project's APE (refer to Figure 1: Project and Resource Location 
Map).  The historic resource is the Social Circle Historic District.  The bridge carrying SR 11 
over the CSX Railroad tracks, Georgia Bridge # 297-0015-0 was determined not eligible for the 
National Register as a part of the Georgia Historic Bridge Survey (see Appendix B). No National 
Register listed or eligible archaeological sites were identified. The historic properties Survey 
Report was submitted to the SHPO and FHWA on December 16, 2005.  The Archaeological 
Assessment was submitted to the SHPO and FHWA on July 30, 2004.  In accordance with 36 
CFR 800.4(c)(2), this property was considered eligible for listing in the National Register by the 
FHWA and the SHPO.   
 
Pursuant to 23 CFR 771.111, various public involvement efforts have been undertaken by the 
Department from the earliest stages of project planning.  According to guidelines set forth in the 
Georgia Department of Transportation Plans Development Process Manual of Guidance, bridge 
replacements are typically categorized as minor projects.  As such, they do not require a public 
hearing. 
 

DESCRIPTION OF HISTORIC PROPERTIES 
 
Social Circle Historic District  
 
The Social Circle Historic District is centered primarily along Cherokee Road (SR 11) in the 
town of Social Circle (refer to Figure 1: Project and Resource Location Map).  The Social Circle 
Historic District is comprised of late nineteenth and early twentieth century commercial, 
industrial, and residential architecture and planned landscaping dating to the town’s boom period 
between 1820 and 1930.  The CSX Railroad, located within the historic district, played an 
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integral part in the development of the City of Social Circle and connected the city to Monroe, 
Georgia in 1880 (refer to National Register Nomination Form in Appendix B).  The resource was 
listed in the National Register in 1980 for its fulfillment of Criteria A and C.  The resource 
possesses a local level of significance in the areas of architecture, landscape architecture, and for 
its association with historical events creating a financial and development boom in the town of 
Social Circle between 1880 and 1930 (refer to the National Register Nomination Form in 
Appendix B). 
 
The listed National Register boundary of the property comprises approximately 132 acres (refer 
to Figure 1: Project and Resource Location Map and the National Register Nomination Form in 
Appendix B). 

 
ASSESSMENT OF EFFECTS 

 
Social Circle Historic District 
 
A finding of Adverse Effect is anticipated for the Social Circle Historic District. In the area of 
the resource, project implementation would consist of the replacement of the existing bridge over 
CSX Railroad on SR 11 with a single two-lane bridge (refer to Figure 2: Contributing Properties 
of the Social Circle Historic District within the APE and Figure 3: Project Improvements within 
the Social Circle Historic District).  The new bridge would be approximately 160 feet in length 
with 44 feet of clear width (per MOG 4265-10). One commercial building within the Social 
Circle Historic District, 304 South Cherokee Road, determined to contribute to the significance 
of the district would be razed in order to facilitate the required tie-in on the east side of SR 11 at 
the north end of the bridge. In order to comply with the CSX Railroad clearance standards, once 
constructed, the bridge would be four feet higher than the existing bridge. One lane of SR 11 
would be closed during staged construction of the new bridge while one lane would remain open, 
and be controlled by temporary signals on either end of the bridge. 
 
Physical destruction of or damage to all or part of the resource would occur. No physical 
destruction or damage would occur to the CSX Transportation.  Project implementation would 
result in the removal of one contributing property, 304 South Cherokee Road, from its historic 
location.  Due to the clearance requirements of CSX Transportation, the bridge height would 
need to be increased approximately 4 feet which would result in an increase of the roadway 
profile along Cherokee Road.  304 South Cherokee Road is located approximately 130 feet from 
the bridge end, and, as a result, the edge of pavement at the existing driveway at 304 South 
Cherokee Road needs to be raised approximately 2.7 feet.  At the shoulder point, with 
construction of an ADA accessible sidewalk, the elevation is approximately 6 feet higher than 
the existing elevation.  The parcel is approximately 0.23 acre and half of its improvements are 
built on the railroad right-of-way.  At the location of the driveway, the parcel is 80 feet deep 
before the railroad right-of-way.  It is 25 feet to the shoulder break point and with the grade of 
the lot it would take 90 feet from centerline to tie the driveway back to the ground elevation 
using a 15% slope, which is higher than the recommended 11% maximum slope for commercial 
driveways.  In order to construct the driveway solely on the property, the percent slope would be 
approximately 20%.  Additionally, if the driveway were constructed, it would be against the 
building, and at the entrance of the building, a wall would need to be built to contain the fill from 
covering the front door.  Also, due to the fact that the property line is approximately 3 feet offset 
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from the northern corner of the building, it is not possible to relocate the driveway north where 
the grade change is less severe.  Finally, because it would not be possible to change the location 
of the driveway and access to the property would be eliminated, the building would be razed.  
The proposed project would require 13,616.08 square feet in permanent easement be acquired 
from seven properties adjacent to the bridge over the CSX tracks, six of which are contributing 
resources within the Social Circle Historic District.  These seven properties are 301 South 
Cherokee Road, 304 South Cherokee Road, 305 South Cherokee Road, 364 South Cherokee 
Road, 379 South Cherokee Road, 303 Cain Street, all of which are contributing properties, and 
315 South Cherokee Road, a non-contributing property in the Social Circle Historic District.  
However, land within the easements would not be destroyed, but rather re-graded for the 
construction of slopes in order to tie into SR 11 as it is elevated in order to accommodate the 
required clearance height of the bridge.  The land within the easements is grassed lawns.  Once 
the grassed lawns are re-graded in order to tie into SR 11, the grass will be replaced.  The 
proposed project would also require 6,860.9089 square feet in temporary easements be acquired 
from eight properties adjacent to SR 11 and the bridge over the CXS tracks, six of which are 
contributing resources within the Social Circle Historic District.  These eight properties are 292 
South Cherokee Road, 298 South Cherokee Road, 305 South Cherokee Road, 315 South 
Cherokee Road, 364 South Cherokee Road, 379 South Cherokee Road, 392 South Cherokee 
Road, and 410 South Cherokee Road.  These easements are necessary in order to tie the eight 
properties’ driveways into SR 11 as it is elevated.  The land within the easements would be re-
graded for the construction of slopes, not destroyed, and the existing driveways would be 
replaced.  Located within the easements at five separate properties are historic steps and, on one 
property, an historic oak tree all of which would be left intact and avoided during construction 
(refer to Images 6, 8, 9, 13, 14, and 21 in Appendix C to see the historic steps and Image 4 to see 
the historic oak tree).  The historic steps are located on the properties of 301 South Cherokee 
Road, 305 South Cherokee Road, 315 South Cherokee Road, 364 South Cherokee Road, and 379 
South Cherokee Road.  The historic oak tree is located on the property of 364 South Cherokee 
Road at the southeast intersection of South Cherokee Road and Cannon Drive.  The historic steps 
and historic oak tree would be left intact and avoided during construction.  Orange safety fencing 
would be placed around all of the historic steps and historic oak tree and will be instituted as 
general notes in the construction contract.  The orange safety fencing around the tree would be 
placed at the back of the easement from Station 101+00 proceeding northward around the radius 
of Cannon Drive.  No additional pavement will encroach into any contributing property within 
the Social Circle Historic District.  Also, access to 304 South Cherokee Road, a contributing 
property, would be eliminated when the roadway is re-graded.  Because access to the property is 
being eliminated, the property would be razed.  A contributing property within the Social Circle 
Historic District would be razed, resulting in a finding of Adverse Effect.   
 
Project implementation would result in a change in the character of the property’s use.  In the 
area of 304 South Cherokee Road, the project would entail the acquisition of permanent 
easement from the property and re-grading of the land within the easement in order to construct 
slopes.  Due to the clearance requirements of CSX Transportation, the edge of pavement at the 
existing driveway at 304 South Cherokee Road needs to be raised approximately 2.7 feet.  While 
the construction fill limits do not encounter the structure at 304 South Cherokee Road, which is 
set back twenty five (25) feet from the existing and proposed edge of pavement, it is not possible 
to tie the existing driveway back into the roadway (please see the paragraph above, beginning on 
page 6, for a full explanation).  Also, due to the fact that the property line is approximately three 
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(3) feet offset from the northern corner of the building, it is not possible to relocate the driveway 
north where the grade change is less severe.  Finally, because it would not be possible to change 
the location of the driveway and access to the property would be eliminated, the building would 
be razed eliminating its ability to be used as a commercial property.  No other changes in use 
would be made to contributing properties within the Social Circle Historic District.    
 
Project implementation would result in a change in the character of the resource’s physical 
features within the property’s setting that contribute to its historic significance. Some features of 
the Social Circle Historic District would be altered as result of project implementation. These 
features include the grassed lawns of six contributing properties and principal residential streets 
within the historic district.  These six contributing properties are 301 South Cherokee Road, 304 
South Cherokee Road, 305 South Cherokee Road, 364 South Cherokee Road, 379 South 
Cherokee Road, and 303 Cain Street.  The grassed lawns would not be destroyed, but rather re-
graded for the construction of slopes in order to tie into SR 11 as it is elevated in order to 
accommodate the required clearance height of the bridge (refer to the Images in Appendix C to 
view the current conditions).  Once the grassed lawns are re-graded in order to tie into SR 11, the 
grass will be replaced.  The grassed lawns of the contributing properties of the Social Circle 
Historic District would be altered as a result of project implementation impacting the viewshed 
to and from the properties.  Other features that would be impacted by project implementation 
include the driveways of six contributing properties within the historic district.  These six 
contributing properties are 292 South Cherokee Road, 298 South Cherokee Road, 305 South 
Cherokee Road, 364 South Cherokee Road, 379 South Cherokee Road, and 392 South Cherokee 
Road.  The driveways would be re-graded and rebuilt in order to tie into SR 11.  The driveways 
of these contributing properties of the Social Circle Historic District would be altered as a result 
of project implementations impacting the viewshed to and from the properties and the setting of 
the historic district.  The proposed project requires gradual re-grading for the construction of 
slopes at points of SR 11 that would tie in with the replacement bridge.  Located within the 
easements at five separate properties are historic steps and, on one property, an historic oak tree 
all of which would be left intact and avoided during construction (refer to Images 6, 8, 9, 13, 14, 
and 21 in Appendix C to see the historic steps and Image 4 to see the historic oak tree).  The 
historic steps are located on the properties of 301 South Cherokee Road, 305 South Cherokee 
Road, 315 South Cherokee Road, 364 South Cherokee Road, and 379 South Cherokee Road.  
The historic oak tree is located on the property of 364 South Cherokee Road at the southeast 
intersection of South Cherokee Road and Cannon Drive.  The historic steps and historic oak tree 
would be left intact and avoided during construction. The clearance of the replacement bridge 
would be four feet higher than the existing bridge’s clearance. The increase in clearance height 
would require that SR 11 to the north and south of the bridge, Southwest Cain Drive, Cannon 
Road, and Hickory Drive be re-graded to accommodate the height change of the bridge (refer to 
the Images in Appendix C to view the current conditions).  No additional pavement will 
encroach into any contributing property within the Social Circle Historic District.  Also, access 
to 304 South Cherokee Road, a contributing property, would be eliminated when the roadway is 
re-graded.  Because access to the property is being eliminated, the property would be razed.  
While the construction fill limits do not encounter the structure at 304 South Cherokee Road, 
which is set back twenty five (25) feet from the existing and proposed edge of pavement, it is not 
possible to tie the existing driveway back into the roadway without modification to the building.  
Also, due to the fact that the property line is approximately three (3) feet offset from the northern 
corner of the building, it is not possible to relocate the driveway north where the grade change is 
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less severe.  The removal of this property would have an adverse effect to the integrity of the 
district’s physical setting.  No construction activity is occurring within the right-of-way of CSX 
Railroad which is considered a contributing property within the historic district.  The historic 
roadway profile would be damaged as a result of the implementation of the project, and a 
contributing property within the Social Circle Historic District would be razed, resulting in a 
finding of Adverse Effect.  
 
Project implementation would result in the introduction of visual elements that diminish the 
integrity of the property’s significant historic characteristics or features.  The setting of the 
Social Circle Historic District would be altered by project implementation.  The project would 
involve increasing the clearance height of the existing bridge by four feet, which would change 
the perspective of the surrounding properties to the bridge, and would also require that land 
associated with properties adjacent to the existing bridge be altered in order to tie-in with SR 11 
and the replacement bridge (refer to the Images in Appendix C to view the current conditions).  
A Modified Texas Rail parapet would be used on the bridge to minimize the visual effect of the 
new bridge on the Social Circle Historic District (see Photograph No. 26 in Appendix C for an 
example of a Texas Rail parapet).  The incorporation of the Modified Texas Rail parapet into the 
design of the new bridge is a stipulation in the attached Memorandum of Agreement and will be 
incorporated as a general note in the construction contract.  Additionally, jump fencing would 
need to be affixed to the bridge; this would introduce a modern element into the viewshed of the 
Social Circle Historic Distrct and have an adverse effect on the district.  The increase in height of 
the new bridge, the regrading of the land associated with contributing properties adjacent to the 
existing bridge, and jump fencing on the new bridge would introduce visual elements that 
diminish the integrity of the property’s setting, resulting in a finding of Adverse Effect.      
 
In the area southeast of the bridge, at 364 South Cherokee Road, 1,423.63 square feet in 
permanent easement would be acquired.  Currently, this property is at the level of the road or 
slightly below the level of the road (refers to Appendix C, Images 8 and 9 to view the current 
conditions).  This property is located 46.75 feet from the centerline of the road.  The proposed 
project would increase the height of the road adjacent to this property by between one to two feet 
in different areas (refer to Figure 3: Project Improvements within the Social Circle Historic 
District to view the location of the property in relation to the SR 11 bridge over CSX).  No 
additional pavement will encroach into the property. 
 
In the area southwest of the bridge, at 379 South Cherokee Road, 3,648.65 square feet in 
permanent easement would be acquired.  Currently, this property is at the level of the road or 
slightly below the level of the road (refers to Appendix C, Images 13 and 14 to view the current 
conditions).  This property is located 36.01 feet from the centerline of the road.  Acquiring a 
permanent easement from this property would be considered adverse because it would re-grade 
the property’s grassed lawn for the construction of slopes in order to tie into SR 11 as it is 
elevated in order to accommodate the required clearance height of the bridge.  As a result of the 
construction of slopes, the height of the road adjacent to this property would increase by between 
one to three feet in different areas resulting in an adverse effect to the viewshed (refer to Figure 
3: Project Improvements within the Social Circle Historic District to view the location of the 
property in relation to the SR 11 bridge over CSX).  No additional pavement will encroach into 
the property. 
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In the area northeast of the bridge, at 304 South Cherokee Road, 1,253.06 square feet in 
permanent easement would be acquired.  Currently, this property is at the level of the road (refer 
to Appendix C, Images 22 and 25 to view the current conditions).  This property is located 35.85 
feet from the centerline.  The proposed project would increase the height of the road adjacent to 
this property by between one to three feet (refer to Figure 3: Project Improvements within the 
Social Circle Historic District to view the location of the property in relation to the SR 11 bridge 
over CSX).  The proposed project would eliminate access to this resource.  As a result, GDOT 
would raze this property.  Razing this property would have a visual adverse effect on the Social 
Circle Historic District as it would eliminate an historic element from the viewshed within the 
historic district.  While the construction fill limits do not encounter the structure at 304 South 
Cherokee Road, which is set back twenty five (25) feet from the existing and proposed edge of 
pavement, it is not possible to tie the existing driveway back into the roadway without 
modification to the building.  Also, due to the fact that the property line is approximately three 
(3) feet offset from the northern corner of the building, it is not possible to relocate the driveway 
north where the grade change is less severe. 
 
In the area northwest of the bridge, at 303 Cain Street, 4,887.66 square feet in permanent 
easement would be acquired.  Currently, this property is below the level of the road (refers to 
Appendix C, Images 18 and 19 to view the current conditions).  This property is located 124.50 
feet from the centerline of the road.  The proposed project would increase the height of the road 
adjacent to this property by between three to four feet (refer to Figure 3: Project Improvements 
within the Social Circle Historic District to view the location of the property in relation to the SR 
11 bridge over CSX).  Raising the height of SR 11 adjacent to this property is considered an 
adverse effect because it would change the perspective of the property to the bridge.  No 
additional pavement will encroach into the property.   
 
Project implementation would not result in the introduction of atmospheric elements that 
diminish the integrity of the property’s significant historic characteristics or features.  There 
would be no atmospheric effect to this property as a result of project implementation.  The 
project is consistent with the State Implementation Plan for air quality in the region. 
 
Project implementation would not result in the introduction of audible elements that diminish the 
integrity of the property’s significant historic characteristics or features. This is a non-capacity 
adding alteration to an existing transportation facility. Changes to the facility are not anticipated 
to change the current noise levels in the project area. The CSX Railroad is not considered a noise 
receptor but a noise generator and would not be impacted by project implementation.  
 
Project implementation is not anticipated to indirectly affect the Social Circle Historic District.  
No permanent changes in traffic patterns would result from project implementation.  No 
additional access to the existing transportation facility would be provided and no existing access 
to the facility would be removed.   
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SUMMARY  
 
Implementation of the proposed project would result in a finding of Adverse Effect for the Social 
Circle Historic District.  
 
 

ALTERNATIVES TO AVOID ADVERSE EFFECT 
 

1. No Build 
2. Social Circle Bypass Route 
3. Rehabilitation of the SR 11 Bridge over CSX Railroad Tracks 
 

Alternative 1, the No Build alternative, was dismissed as a prudent and feasible alternative that 
would avoid causing adverse effects to the Social Circle Historic District to the preferred 
proposed project because it did not fulfill the assessed purpose and need of the project. The No 
Build Alternative does not solve the issue of the bridge’s below acceptable Sufficiency Rating, 
nor does this alternative resolve the sub-standard load capacity construction of the bridge, as 
required by the Office of Bridge Maintenance.   
 
Alternative 2, the Social Circle Bypass Route, was dismissed as a prudent and feasible 
alternative to the preferred proposed project because it would create adverse effects to the Social 
Circle Historic District by creating a bypass eliminating truck access to the area, which is 
currently afforded by the bridge carrying SR 11 over the CSX Railroad tracks. State Route 11 
provides a major access route for automobiles and trucks traveling to the center of Social Circle 
from Interstate 20. The two other bridges providing access to the downtown area of Social Circle 
have already restricted the crossing of vehicles meeting a specific weight threshold, which has 
limited access of trucks to the town center. This change in access would negatively affect the 
commercial and industrial properties that rely upon deliveries and pick-ups by such type 
vehicles, as well as the commerce that results from the drivers of these type vehicles frequenting 
local Social Circle businesses along Cherokee Road. The bypass would eventually cause a 
situation making the continued use of the industrial and commercial properties on and directly 
off SR 11/Cherokee Road less desirable. Additionally, the bypass would not resolve the 
structural deficiency problems with the existing bridge. Even if crossing of the existing bridge is 
restricted to automobiles, the bridge has structural capacity issues that require repair. 
 
Alternative 3, the rehabilitation of the bridge carrying SR 11 over the CSX Railroad tracks has 
been dismissed as an alternative because the existing condition of the bridge is beyond a point of 
repair. GDOT engineers observed that the steel beams of the bridge are warped and that concrete 
bents are cracked. While this alternative would eliminate the need to meet the CSX Railroad 
clearance height standards because wholesale replacement of the bridge would be avoided, the 
observed conditions of the bridge preclude the structure from this type of repair.  

 
 

PLANNING TO MINIMIZE HARM AND PROPOSED MITIGATION 
 
Planning to minimize harm was taken into consideration to the extent possible during project 
development. The initial project design included guardrails and retaining walls to avoid requiring 
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the need to acquire land from any of the properties considered contributing to the Social Circle 
Historic District adjacent to the bridge; however, it was later determined that construction of the 
retaining walls would adversely affect historic features of the setting, as well as the view shed of 
the properties within the district. Other means were found to accommodate the grade change 
without constructing retaining walls.  When it was determined that the construction of the new 
bridge would introduce a visual element that would diminish the integrity of the Social Circle 
Historic District, it was decided that a Texas Rail parapet would be used in the design of the new 
bridge to minimize the visual effect of the bridge on the property.  It has also been determined 
that the five sets of concrete steps, located at 301 South Cherokee Road, 305 South Cherokee 
Road, 315 South Cherokee Road, 364 South Cherokee Road, and 379 South Cherokee Road, and 
one historic oak tree, located at 364 South Cherokee Road, are significant elements within the 
Social Circle Historic District’s landscape.  The concrete steps and oak tree will be left intact and 
avoided during construction.  The use of the Texas Rail bridge design and avoidance of the 
concrete steps and oak tree will be incorporated as general notes to the construction contract.         
   
 

STIPULATIONS 
 
The following mitigation measure is proposed for discussion at consultation between the FHWA 
and the SHPO:  
 

1. Prior to project implementation, GDOT will ensure that representative views of the 
Social Circle Historic District’s setting within the project area will be photographed with 
high resolution digital photography per the National Register Photo Policy. 

 
2. GDOT will ensure that Modified Texas Rail will be used in the design of the new bridge 

to minimize the visual effect of the bridge on the Social Circle Historic District. 
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             Image Log  



Client Name: 

Georgia Department of 
Transportation 

GDOT Project: BRST0-0052-01(012)  

Image No. 
1 

 
 

 
 
 

Description:  
View of the northeast 
intersection of Cannon 
Drive and Laurel Drive 
and a contributing 
property within the 
Social Circle Historic 
District (346 Laurel 
Drive), view facing 
southwest  
 
 

Image No. 2 
 

Description:  
View of Laurel Drive 
from 346 Laurel Drive, 
view facing west 
 
 



Client Name: 

Georgia Department of 
Transportation 

GDOT Project: BRST0-0052-01(012)  

Image No. 
3 

 
 

 
 
 

Description:  
View of the northeast 
intersection of Cannon 
Drive and Laurel Drive, 
view facing west 
 
 

Image No. 4 
 

Description:  
View of the front 
grassed lawn (including 
historic oak tree) of 364 
South Cherokee Road, 
view facing west 
 
 

 



Client Name: 

Georgia Department of 
Transportation 

GDOT Project: BRST0-0052-01(012)  

Image No. 
5 

 
 

 
 
 

Description:  
View of the southeast 
intersection of SR 
11/South Cherokee 
Road and Cannon 
Drive, facing southeast 
 

Image No. 6 
 

Description:  
View of the front 
grassed lawn of 364 
South Cherokee Road, 
view facing west 
 



Client Name: 

Georgia Department of 
Transportation 

GDOT Project: BRST0-0052-01(012)  

Image No. 
7 

 
 

 
 
 

Description:  
View of the front 
grasses lawn of 364 
South Cherokee Road, 
view facing west 
 
 

Image No. 8 
 

Description:  
View of SR 11 and 
property right-of-way 
from 364 South 
Cherokee Road, facing 
northwest 
 
 

 



Client Name: 

Georgia Department of 
Transportation 

GDOT Project: BRST0-0052-01(012)  

Image No. 
9 

 
 

 
 
 

Description:  
View of SR 11 and 
property right-of-way 
from 364 South 
Cherokee Road, facing 
north 
 
 

Image No. 10 
 

Description:  
View of SR 11/South 
Cherokee Road and a 
contributing property 
within the Social Circle 
Historic District (392 
South Cherokee Road), 
view facing north 
 
 



Client Name: 

Georgia Department of 
Transportation 

GDOT Project: BRST0-0052-01(012)  

Image No. 
11 

 
 

 
 
 

Description:  
View of SR 11/South 
Cherokee Road and a 
contributing property 
within the Social Circle 
Historic District (392 
South Cherokee Road), 
view facing northeast 
 
 

Image No. 12 
 

Description:  
View of SR 11/South 
Cherokee Road and a 
contributing property 
within the Social Circle 
Historic District (379 
South Cherokee Road), 
view facing north 
 
 
 
 

 



Client Name: 

Georgia Department of 
Transportation 

GDOT Project: BRST0-0052-01(012)  

Image No. 
13 

 
 

 
 
 

Description:  
View of SR 11 and 
property right-of-way 
from 379 South 
Cherokee Road, facing 
northeast 
 
 

Image No. 14 
 

Description:  
View of SR 11 and 
property right-of-way 
from 379 South 
Cherokee Road, facing 
east 
 
 
 



Client Name: 

Georgia Department of 
Transportation 

GDOT Project: BRST0-0052-01(012)  

Image No. 
15 

 
 

 
 
 

Description:  
View of SR 11/South 
Cherokee Road 
southern approach to 
the bridge over CSX, 
view facing south 
 
 

Image No. 16 
 

Description:  
View of SR 11/South 
Cherokee Road 
northern bridge 
approach and 
contributing properties 
within the Social Circle 
Historic District (305 
South Cherokee Road 
and 301 South 
Cherokee Road), view 
facing northwest 
 
 

 
 
 
 



 
Client Name: 

Georgia Department of 
Transportation 

GDOT Project: BRST0-0052-01(012)  

Image No. 
17 

 
 

 
 
 

Description:  
View of SR 11/South 
Cherokee Road 
northern bridge 
approach and the bridge 
over CSX, view facing 
north 
 
 

Image No. 18 
 

Description:  
View of SR 11 and 
property right-of-way 
from 303 Cain Street, 
facing southeast 
 
 



Client Name: 

Georgia Department of 
Transportation 

GDOT Project: BRST0-0052-01(012)  

Image No. 
19 

 
 

 
 
 

Description:  
View of SR 11 and 
property right-of-way 
from 303 Cain Street, 
facing northeast 
 
 

Image No. 20 
 

Description:  
View of the front 
grassed lawns of 305 
South Cherokee Road 
(on the left) and 301 
South Cherokee Road 
(on the right), view 
facing north 
 
 

 



Client Name: 

Georgia Department of 
Transportation 

GDOT Project: BRST0-0052-01(012)  

Image No. 
21 

 
 

 
 
 

Description:  
View of the front lawn 
of 301 South Cherokee 
Road and the northern 
bridge approach, view 
facing south 
 

Image No. 22 
 

Description:  
View of SR 11 and 
property right-of-way 
from 304 South 
Cherokee Road, facing 
northwest 
 
 
 



Client Name: 

Georgia Department of 
Transportation 

GDOT Project: BRST0-0052-01(012)  

Image No. 
23 

 
 

 
 
 

Description:  
View of SR 11/South 
Cherokee Road 
northern approach to 
the bridge, view facing 
south 
 
 

Image No. 24 
 

Description:  
View of SR 11/South 
Cherokee Road and 
contributing properties 
within the Social Circle 
Historic District (284 
South Cherokee Road, 
292 South Cherokee 
Road, 292 South 
Cherokee Road, and 
304 South Cherokee 
Road), view facing 
southeast 
 
 

 



Client Name: 

Georgia Department of 
Transportation 

GDOT Project: BRST0-0052-01(012)  

Image No. 
25 

 
 

 
 
 

Description:  
View of SR 11 and 
property right-of-way 
from 304 South 
Cherokee Road, facing 
southwest 
 
 

Image No. 26 
 

Description: 
Photographic example 
of a Texas Rail parapet 
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